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ABSTRACT 

The paper focuses on the international dimension of the digital divide, i.e. the discrepancy be­
tween developed and developing countries in their access to information technologies. It exam­
ines in how far public international law supports the reduction of the digital divide with regard to 
the use of satellite telecommunications. Against the background of a factual digital divide be­
tween nations, and considering that information technologies, including satellite, are major tools 
for participation in the global information society, the investigation leads to one major question: 
is there a right of states to (benefit from) satellite telecommunications? Focus in the examination 
of this question is on international telecommunications law, on space law, and on international 
economic law. Rules of customary international law are also being analysed. 

I. INTRODUCTION 

Telecommunications infrastructure and ser­
vices are widely acknowledged as indispen­
sable tools for the socio-economic and cul­
tural development of a country, offering 
unprecedented opportunities for the better­
ment of quality of life for all.1 However, 
many regions of the world still have only 
very limited telecommunications penetra­
tion. 2 This discrepancy is widely known as a 
facet of the 'digital divide', i.e. the gap be­
tween those who have access to the latest in­
formation technologies and those who do 
not. 3 Whereas a digital divide can not only 
be perceived between different countries 
(industrial nations/developing countries), but 
also between regions of a single country (ur-
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(urban/rural areas), focus of this paper will 
be on the international dimension of the di­
vide. This international divide has caused 
serious concerns in developing countries and 
international institutions like the United Na­
tions; 4 initiatives such as the recent World 
Summit on the Information Society (WSIS) 
give evidence of these concerns. Against the 
background that satellite telecommunica­
tions can help bridging the digital divide by 
supplying remote areas with telecommunica­
tions, I examine whether developing coun­
tries have any specific rights in public inter­
national law regarding the access to satellite 
telecommunications. The legal problems 
will be investigated in the context of the ap­
plicable multilateral rules of international 
telecommunications law, space law and in­
ternational economic law. Recent develop-
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merits such as WSIS 2003/2005 in Geneva 
and Tunis respectively will also be taken 
into account. Regional public international 
law (e.g. EC law) will not be considered. 

II. THE INTERNATIONAL DIVIDE 

The term "digital divide" was coined in the 
United States towards the end of the 1990s.5 

Already before the process of "digitization" 
had taken place, however, the problem of an 
international "divide" with respect to tele­
communications access was perceived by 
the "McBride-Commission" 6 in 1980 and by 
the "Maitland-Commission" 7 in 1984. The 
latter observed that two-thirds of the world 
population had no access to telephone ser­
vices, and Tokyo had more telephones than 
the whole of the African continent.8 While 
this statement has been cited on several oc­
casions also recently, it is clear that in times 
of mobile telecommunications this does not 
hold entirely true for our times. In Mid-
2005, only eight national economies (with a 
population of less than 160 m. inhabitants or 
approx. 2.5% of the world's population) had 
a combined "teledensity"9 (landlines and 
mobile) of less than one. The global teleden­
sity figures around 50. 1 0 Even though the 
situation may thus have improved, there re­
mains a significant disparity as between in­
dustrialised and developing countries with 
regard to telecommunications technologies. 
This conclusion can clearly be drawn from 
the UNDP Human Development Report of 
2003, according to which developing coun­
tries possess 113 land lines per 1000 inhabi­
tants, compared to 562 in high-income 
states. Even with regard to mobile phones 
there still are disparities: 134 users per 1000 
inhabitants in developing countries compare 
to 710 users in high-income countries. Com­
ing to speak of the internet use, the report 

counts 53 internet users per 1000 inhabitants 
in developing countries as opposed to 477 
per 1000 inhabitants in high-income coun­
tries. 1 1 The findings of the ITU World Tele-
communication/ICT Development Report 
2006 underscore these results. 1 2 

III. SATELLITES AS A TOOL FOR 

BRIDGING THE DIGITAL DIVIDE 

Obviously, the digital divide can be bridged 
by various technological means. 1 3 However, 
satellites offer some specific advantages 
making them extremely apt for bridging the 
digital divide. Major advantages of satellites 
are their broad geographical coverage as 
well as the avoidance of expensive terrestrial 
infrastructures, such as cable, and the practi­
cally unlimited number of transmission re­
cipients, but also the possibility to build up 
global networks. 1 4 Regardless of some dis­
advantages to satellite communications, 1 5 

satellite systems are the only means to con­
nect all those states that are not linked to op­
tical fibre networks to the international 
communications network ("lifeline connec­
tivity"). To date, still almost two thirds of all 
states can only obtain international connec­
tions via the INTELSAT system. 1 6 As an in­
tegral part of the global "information high­
ways", satellite communications comple­
ment the linking of distant regions through 
submarine cables, 1 7 and alongside optical 
fibre constitute the backbone of the informa­
tion society. 1 8 Satellites are thus perfectly 
well suited for bridging the digital divide. 

TV. WHY BRIDGE THE DIVIDE? 

The lack of sufficient development in tele­
communication facilities and the availability 
of efficient and cheap services in developing 
countries are due to various reasons, inter 
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alia a lack of priority, since telecommunica­
tions were and often still are considered a 
luxury. 1 9 This may raise the question of why 
the international community should be con­
cerned with the problem. 
However, information and communications 
in modern society are neither a luxury nor a 
comfort, but a necessity. 2 0 Information and 
Communication Technology (ICT) can be 
used to promote economic growth 2 1 (in 
2003, the global telecom market revenue 
was US$ 1.426 billion) 2 2. Moreover, ICTs' 
role in promoting peace, security and stabil­
ity, in enhancing democracy, social cohe­
sion, good governance and the rule of law, at 
national, regional and international levels, 
has just recently been underscored by the 
ITU. 2 3 Accordingly, the need to address the 
international digital divide globally has also 
been recognised by international organisa­
tions and fora. 2 4 The final WSIS outcome 
documents emphasise the growing impor­
tance of ICTs as a development enabler, and 
as a tool for achieving the internationally 
agreed development goals and objectives, 
including the Millennium Development 
Goals (MDGs). 2 5 These considerations are 
expressions of the more general concept of 
"global public interest", which thus stands 
behind the idea of bridging the divide inter­
nationally. 
It is clear that in the end, bridging the digital 
must serve the objective of providing high 
quality services to all people at an affordable 
price. 6 Insofar, the concept of digital divide 
is closely connected to the notions of "uni­
versal service" and "universal access". 
These are of a purely national nature, how­
ever, requiring regulatory initiatives of the 
respective nation states. Bridging the digital 
divide in a global perspective applies to an­
other level though, in that it is concerned 
with the prerequisites for states that aim at 

universal service/access nationally: enabling 
states to acquire the necessary means to 
build up national telecommunications to 
cover their entire territory. 

V. STATES' RIGHTS IN PUBLIC IN­

TERNATIONAL LAW 

It shall thus be asked whether public interna­
tional law confers specific rights to states, 
i.e. developing countries, concerning satel­
lite telecommunications. 
Legal claims of developing countries in this 
respect might result from all sources of pub­
lic international law. These are listed in 
Art. 38 para. 1 of the Statute of the Interna­
tional Court of Justice. 2 7 Focus of this paper 
will be especially on international agree­
ments and rules of customary international 
law. Of particular interest are norms of in­
ternational telecommunications law, of in­
ternational economic law (esp. within the 
WTO), and of space law. It seems feasible to 
examine the legal rights according to the ob­
ject of potential claims. Yet, it would go be­
yond the scope of this paper to examine all 
relevant provisions in detail. I will thus fo­
cus on the main aspects. 

1. Access to the orbit/spectrum resource 

The operation of telecommunication satel­
lites necessitates availability of orbital posi­
tions and radio frequencies to communicate 
with Earth stations. Developing countries 
intending to build up their own satellite tele­
communications system are thus dependent 
on access to the orbit/spectrum resource. In 
terms of orbital positions for telecommuni­
cations, the GEO is usually preferred since it 
offers many advantages. 8 Located at 
approx. 36.000 km above the equator 2 9 satel­
lites revolve at the same rate as the Earth, so 
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that they appear stationary viewed from the 
Earth. 3 0 For an almost complete global cov­
erage three satellites are sufficient.31 The 
GEO accordingly enables global coverage 
with only a few satellites, which with an av­
erage lifetime of 15 years have a considera­
bly long life span. Due to the physical char­
acteristics of radio waves, also only certain 
frequencies are suitable for communication 
via satellite. 3 2 In the following, I examine 
whether international agreements or rules of 
customary international law provide for 
rights to access certain positions in the GEO 
as the subject of the most heated discussion 
(and to use certain associated frequencies). 

1.1 Art. 44 (2) ITU-Constitution 

Developing countries that are members of 
the International Telecommunications Union 
(ITU) 3 3 might be able to claim access to the 
orbit/spectrum resource according to Art. 44 
(2) of the ITU-Constitution 3 4. Pursuant to 
this Article, "Member States shall bear in 
mind that radio frequencies and any associ­
ated orbits, including the geostationary orbit, 
are limited natural resources", which "must 
be used rationally, efficiently and economi­
cally [...] so that countries or groups of 
countries may have equitable access to those 
orbits and frequencies, taking into account 
the special needs of the developing countries 
and the geographical situation of particular 
countries." 
First of all, it is important to note that the 
provision explicitly addresses member states 
that "shall bear in mind" the limited nature 
of the resources. That wording emphasises 
the fact that under general international law, 
particularly the principles of sovereignty and 
territorial jurisdiction, the regulation and 
control of national telecommunications be­
longs to the domaine réservé of states. 3 5 

Therefore, in principle, each nation state is 

responsible for the assignment of frequen­
cies to certain users; the ITU itself is not in a 
position to assign the frequencies37. Accord­
ingly, as a first result, it can be clearly stated 
that developing countries members to the 
ITU cannot claim to be assigned certain spe­
cific frequencies (and associated orbital po­
sitions) by the ITU. 
However, Art. 44 (2) CS emphasises that the 
frequency/orbit spectrum is physically lim­
ited. 3 8 Consequently, states are necessarily 
restricted in their use of frequencies and as­
sociated orbital positions. Therefore, inter­
national coordination is necessary in order to 
avoid conflicts and enable the most efficient 
use of the resources in question. 3 9 The need 
of such cooperation is reinforced by the fact 
that frequencies inevitably extend beyond 
state boundaries. 4 0 International recognition 
of a nationally assigned frequency is thus vi­
tal for the use of such frequency free from 
harmful interference by other users. To this 
end, the ITU has the task, by virtue of Art. 1 
(2) (a) CS, to "effect allocation of bands 
[...], the allotment of radiofrequencies and 
the registration of radiofrequency assign­
ments and, for space services, of any associ­
ated orbital position in the geostationary or­
bit [...]". The ITU radio frequencies 
distribution process therefore encompasses 
the allocation 4 1 of radio frequencies to cer­
tain services, 4 2 and the allotment 4 3 of radio 
frequencies to different countries (a priori 
planning). 4 4 

For services that are allocated certain fre­
quencies, 4 5 the basis for international recog­
nition of a nationally assigned frequency is 
that of "first come, first served", meaning 
that the user that first notified ITU of the use 
of a specific frequency will be legally pro­
tected from interference. This may favour 
the technologically advanced countries and 
has thus been challenged by the developing 
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countries. Therefore, the system of a priori 
planning, with WARC 1977's allotment plan 
for regions 1 and 3 (Europe, Asia, Austra­
lia), and with the WARC 1983's allotment 
plan for region 2 (America), indicated a cer­
tain trend towards an international admini­
stration of frequencies and orbital posi­
tions. 4 7 Nevertheless, to date "first come, 
first served" is still the dominant principle. 4 8 

The problem that becomes evident from the 
discussions on the two systems is that of a 
fair balance between "efficient and eco­
nomic use" and "equitable access". Whereas 
Art. 44 (2) CS imposes an obligation on ITU 
member states to use the orbit/spectrum re­
source efficiently and economically in order 
to ensure equitable access by all countries, 4 9 

the ITU regulatory regime does not give a 
definition of any of these terms. 
The interpretation of efficient and economic 
use of the orbit/spectrum resource is left to 
the discretion of each ITU member. How­
ever, member states have impliedly agreed 
to the objective of "equitable access". 5 0 

Generally, the concept of equity relates to 
principles of justice and fairness;5 1 in the 
context of Art. 44 (2) CS, the meaning of the 
term "equitable access" is further clarified 
when considering two other provisos, i.e. 
that countries may have equitable access 
only in conformity with the Radio Regula­
tions, and that the special needs of the de­
veloping countries and the geographical 
situation of particular countries must be 
taken into account while making use of the 
orbit/spectrum resource. 5 2 

Against this background, developing coun­
tries have a right to access those orbital posi­
tions and use the associated frequencies that 
have been assigned to them in the allotment 
plans. Their notifications to the Table of 
Frequency Allocations of the ITU Radio 
Regulations are also internationally pro­

tected. Any "equitable access", however, 
depends on the design of the Radio Regula­
tions. Developing countries are thus depend­
ant on further international cooperation in 
this field. 

1.2 Art. I OST 

Developing countries might be able to claim 
access to the GEO and the associated fre­
quencies pursuant to the 1967 Outer Space 
Treaty (OST). The principles of the OST are 
generally viewed as part of customary inter­
national law, thus binding also states that are 

53 

not members to the Treaty. 
Art. I (2) OST provides for freedom to ex­
plore and use outer space, the Moon and 
other celestial bodies. This includes the use 
of the GEO, also for commercial purposes. 5 4 

Even though this is not expressly stated in 
Art. I (2) OST, the US in response to the 
Bogota Declaration of eight equatorial states 
in 1976 emphasised that "commercial satel­
lite communications activities utilizing the 
geostationary orbit were well in hand and 
were widely known at the time, and no ob­
jection or exception to those activities was 
made either in the text of the treaty or during 
its negotiation"5 5. States, including develop­
ing countries, are thus entitled to use the 
GEO and related frequencies in outer space. 
Such use is not unlimited, however. Rather, 
Art. I (1) OST provides that "the exploration 
and use [...] shall be carried out for the 
benefit and in the interests of all countries, 
irrespective of their degree of economic or 
scientific development, and shall be the 
province of all mankind." Although this 
provision also limits the space activities of 
developing countries, it could be understood 
to grant to them rights in case they are pre­
vented from space activities (i.e. satellite 
telecommunications) due to the use of spe­
cific orbital positions and frequencies by de-
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veloped countries. Yet, already at the time 
of ratification of the OST, the US Senate 
expressly stated that nothing in Article I, 
para. 1 "[.. .] diminishes or alters the right of 
the United States to determine how it shares 
the benefits and results of its space activi­
t ies." 5 6 This understanding was later con­
firmed by the 1996 Space Benefits Declara­
t ion 5 7 which, while acknowledging the need 
for international cooperation, leaves it to the 
states to determine all aspects of their par­
ticipation in such international cooperation 
(para. 2) . 5 8 In the field of satellite telecom­
munications, international cooperation was 
concretised by the ITU legal framework.59 

Thus, Art. I (1) OST in any case may not go 
further in its conferral of rights than does the 
ITU regulatory framework examined previ­
ously. 

1.3 Para. 6 WTO Reference Paper 

Para. 6 of the WTO Reference Paper 6 0 ac­
knowledges the right of a WTO Member to 
exercise spectrum/frequency management, 
provided it is carried out in an objective, 
timely, transparent and non-discriminatory 
manner. 6 1 States that have accepted the Ref­
erence Paper are thus obliged to an objec­
tive, timely, transparent and non­
discriminatory spectrum/frequency man­
agement. However, the Reference Paper re­
flects a global consensus on key regulatory 
issues for opening telecommunication mar­
kets to competition. 6 2 It thus aims at liberal­
ising national markets, and does not confer 
any rights to developing countries regarding 
access to the frequency/spectrum resource. 

1.4 Common Heritage of Mankind 

Certain areas that are not subject to state 
sovereignty have been declared the common 
heritage of mankind (CHOM). Regarding 

the Moon and other celestial bodies, this has 
been stated in Art. 11 (1) of the Moon 
Agreement of 1979. The Outer Space Treaty 
only speaks of outer space activities as the 
province of all mankind, however. If the 
concept of common heritage of mankind 
was also applicable to outer space per se, it 
might confer participatory rights regarding 
satellite telecommunications for developing 
countries. It is questionable, however, 
whether a concept exceeding the contents of 
Art. I (1) OST could exist with the CHOM 
principle applying to the whole of outer 
space. In any case, state practice after the 
Moon Agreement suggests that one-sided, 
rigid obligations for the attainment of dis­
tributive justice is not provided by the 
CHOM principle. 6 3 

2. Transfer of (Space) Technologies 

With regard to satellite telecommunications, 
developing countries may have a desire to 
take an active part in the development and 
operation of satellite systems, and to partici­
pate in the industrial development aspects of 
such systems. 6 4 It could thus be asked 
whether developing countries can claim a 
right to be transferred technologies by de­
veloped countries. However, it should be 
kept in mind that intellectual property rights 
(IPRs) 6 5 in technologies are usually vested 
with subjects of private law. Against the 
background of privatisation in the telecom­
munications sector, and commercialisation 
of space activities, this will also be true with 
regard to space technologies. Public interna­
tional law might have implications in so far 
as it may influence the specific national 
laws, or it may even oblige states to a spe­
cific administrative conduct. In the latter 
case, an industrial state might come under a 
duty to assert the rights to dispose of the re­
spective IPRs so as to be able to directly 
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transfer these rights to developing coun­
tries. 6 6 

Forms of transfer of intellectual property 
comprise a transfer of literature, education 
of local workers, delegation of technicians, 
engineers and managers, supply of industrial 
goods and/or industrial plants, patent li­
cences, know-how-licences, technical assis­
tance, and direct investments (industrial co­
operation, joint ventures, subsidiaries).6 7 Of 
central importance is the transfer of know-
how, which has been defined as "the sum 
tota of specialist knowledge, operational ex­
perience, and the technical production of a 
manufacturer." 6 8 Irrespective of the failure 
of negotiations on an international Code of 
Conduct on the Transfer of Technology in 
1985, technology transfer of developing 
countries has been a recurrent theme in the 
multilateral discussions of recent years. 6 9 

2.1 Art. IX OST 

Since the specific interest in the context of 
this paper is on satellite telecommunications, 
it may be asked whether space law holds 
rights of developing countries to be trans­
ferred space technologies. According to Art. 
IX, sentence 1 of the OST, states shall be 
guided by the principle of cooperation and 
mutual assistance in the exploration and use 
of outer space. This wording again is very 
vague, however, and does not provide de­
tailed obligations for international coopera­
tion. 7 0 Also the details for mutual assistance 
are not provided in Art. IX OST. Taking into 
account para. 2 of the Space Benefits Decla­
ration of 1996, 7 1 it is doubtful that Art. LX 
OST confers specific rights to developing 
countries regarding the transfer of space 
technology. 

2.2 Art. 66 (21 TRIPS 

A right of developing countries to be trans­
ferred technologies in general, and thus also 
space technologies, might be founded in Art. 
66 (2) of the Agreement on Trade-Related 
Aspects of Intellectual Property Rights 
(TRIPS). Art. 66 (2) TRIPS contains a gen­
eral obligation of developed country Mem­
bers to promote technology transfer to least-
developed countries (LDCs). 7 2 To this end, 
they are under a duty to provide incentives 
to enterprises and institutions in their terri­
tory to increasingly engage in transfer of 
technology to developing countries. 7 3 

Whereas the precise scope of this duty sug­
gests a considerable discretion on the part of 
the industrial countries, it is clear that the 
obligation exists and must be discharged. 7 4 

This is emphasised by the general objectives 
of TRIPS as contained in Articles 7 and 8, 
which provide that the protection of IPRs 
have to contribute to the promotion of tech­
nical innovation and the transfer and dis­
semination of technology, in a manner con­
ducive to social and economic welfare, and 
to the balance of rights and obligations. 7 5 

Moreover, the Doha WTO Ministerial Con­
ference in 2001 agreed that the industrialised 
countries would give an annual notification 
of their measures undertaken with respect to 
their obligation under Art. 66 (2) TRIPS. 7 6 

These notifications7 7 show that the obliga­
tion contained in Art. 66 (2) TRIPS is taken 
seriously. 7 8 The developed countries' discre­
tion is further reduced by the Decision of the 
WTO Council for TRIPS in 2003 concern­
ing the implementation of Art. 66 (2) 
TRIPS 7 9 , which lays down an obligation of 
developed country members to submit re­
ports on actions taken or envisaged to pro­
vide incentives for the promotion of tech­
nology transfer.8 0 
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As a result, according to Art. 66 (2) TRIPS, 
developed countries are thus obliged to 
promote the transfer of technology to devel­
oping countries. 8 1 However, a specified right 
of developing countries to be transferred 
certain technology does not result thereof. 

2.3 Art. IV GATS 

A treatment parallel to that of Art. 66 (2) 
TRIPs can be found in Art. IV of the Gen­
eral Agreement on Trade in Services 
(GATS). 8 2 According to Art. IV (1) GATS 
an increasing participation in world trade of 
developing country members shall be facili­
tated through negotiated specific commit­
ments. This shall for instance be achieved by 
the strengthening of their domestic services 
capacity and its efficiency and competitive­
ness, inter alia through access to technology 
on a commercial basis. Member states are 
thus required to negotiate specific commit­
ments in this respect under Part III and IV of 
the GATS. However, Art. IV (1) GATS has 
been referred to as "a statement of good in­
tentions" 8 3 concerning the consideration of 
the interests of developing countries. Indus­
trialised countries are thus not obliged to 
make specific concessions for developing 
countries. 8 4 

Art. IV (2) GATS obliges developed country 
Members to establish contact points within 
two years from the date of entry into force 
of the WTO Agreement so as to facilitate the 
access of developing country Members' ser­
vice suppliers to information, related to their 
respective markets. Of specific interest to 
developing countries in this respect is in­
formation concerning the improvement of 
professional qualifications and the availabil­
ity of service technology. 8 5 Yet the wording 
of Art. IV (2) GATS indicates that a right to 
obtain certain information concerning spe­
cific technologies is not included. All in all, 

Art. IV does not contain any substantial pro­
vision favouring the economically weak 
states. 8 6 Developing countries can not claim 
transfer of satellite telecommunications 
technology from developed countries ac­
cording to Art. IV GATS. 

2.4 Para. 6 of the GATS Annex on Tele­
communications 

The GATS Annex on Telecommunications 8 7 

expressly acknowledges the telecommunica­
tions sector's dual role as a distinct sector of 
economic activity and as the underlying 
transport means for other economic activi­
ties. 8 Its rationale is to ensure that countries 
agreeing to trade in various services also of­
fer adequate telecommunications facilities to 
deliver these services across the border or 
within their own territory. While the Annex 
is therefore primarily concerned with the ac­
cess to markets and the use of infrastruc­
tures, it does at the same time recognise the 
special needs of developing countries. In 
this respect, it encourages technical coopera­
tion in order to establish an efficient, ad­
vanced telecommunications infrastructure to 
expand their trade in services. 8 9 To this end, 
para. 6 (c) of the Annex provides that "[. . .] 
Members shall make available, where prac­
ticable, to developing countries information 
with respect to telecommunications services 
and developments in telecommunications 
and information technology to assist in 
strengthening their domestic telecommuni­
cations services sector." However, the word­
ing "where practicable" indicates that mem­
bers retain a wide discretion regarding the 
provision of such information. Any specific 
rights of developing countries to obtain such 
information can thus not be derived from 
para. 6 (c) of the Annex. 
With regard to LDCs, para. 6 (d) of the An­
nex stipulates that "Members shall give spe-
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cial consideration to opportunities for the 
least-developed countries to encourage for­
eign suppliers of telecommunications ser­
vices to assist in the transfer of technology 
[...]". Also here, it becomes obvious that, 
while Members are called upon to promote 
the transfer of technology to LDCs, no spe­
cific rights of developing countries to trans­
fer of technology are contained in the provi­
sion. Para. 6 of the Annex thus does not 
confer rights to developing countries with 
regard to the transfer of technology. 

2.5 Fourth Protocol and Reference 
Paper 

The Fourth Protocol to the GATS 9 0 in its 
Annex contains schedules of specific com­
mitments and a list of exemptions from 
Art. II GATS (national treatment) concern­
ing basic telecommunications services. 
Whereas the precise meaning of the term 
"basic telecommunications services" was 
not clarified, it is clear that it principally in­
cludes all sorts of national and international 
telecommunications services such as e.g. 
voice telephony, data transmission, fax, 
facsimile, and also fixed and mobile satellite 
systems and services; 9 1 broadcasting of ra­
dio and television programmes is not in­
cluded. 9 2 The specific commitments under­
taken mainly encompass regulations for 
market access of foreign companies, for for­
eign investments and for ensuring competi­
tion through certain regulatory principles. 9 3 

The schedules annexed to the Fourth Proto­
col do not provide for transfer of technol­
ogy, however. 
For the same reason, the Reference Paper 9 4 

cannot confer rights to developing countries 
regarding the transfer of technology. 
Whereas it may help market access of de­
veloping countries to those of developed na-

tions, it does not contain any rights regard­
ing transfer of technology. 

3. Provision of continued telecommunica­
tions services 

Developing countries might be entitled to be 
provided with continued telecommunica­
tions services. This aspect was of great con­
cern to developing countries in the course of 
INTELSAT'S privatisation. Countries quali­
fied as "lifeline countries" were granted to 
enter into Lifeline Connectivity Obligation 
(LCO) commitments. 9 5 Lifeline Connec­
tivity Obligation (LCO) is the obligation as­
sumed by Intelsat Ltd. as set out in the LCO 
contract to provide continued telecommuni­
cations services to the LCO customer. 9 6 

LCO are obligations from an agreement in 
private law between the private company In­
telsat Ltd. and the respective states. ITSO, 
the remaining international satellite organi­
sation, is not party to these agreements (and 
does not even have the facilities to provide 
such services), but instead is responsible for 
ensuring that the private company fulfils its 
obligations contained in these contracts. 9 7 

As a result, claims in public international 
law can only be raised against ITSO to exer­
cise its obligation to ensure Intelsat Ltd.'s 
conformity with the LCO commitment. 
Consequently, there is no valid claim against 
ITSO to provide such services, however. 

4. Universal service obligations 

Pursuant to para. 3 of the Reference Paper, 
any member has the right to define the kind 
of universal service obligation it wishes to 
maintain in spite of market liberalisation. 
Such obligations will not be regarded as 
anti-competitive per se, provided they are 
administered in a transparent, non­
discriminatory and competitively neutral 
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manner and are not more burdensome than 
necessary for the kind of universal service 
defined by the Member. Universal service 
obligations are thus in principle accepted, 
although they may hinder competition. 

5. International cooperation 

The remaining question, then, is whether 
there are any participatory rights of develop­
ing countries resulting from other sources of 
public international law. Basically all of the 
provisions examined above are expressions 
of some kind of strive towards international 
cooperation, also in the field of satellite tele­
communications. In this respect, they may 
certainly be seen in the spirit of the purposes 
of the United Nations as laid down in Art. I 
of the UN Charter, and the UN Friendly Re­
lations Declaration of 1970 9 8 , which reaf­
firms that the maintenance of international 
peace and security and the development of 
friendly relations and cooperation between 
nations are among the fundamental purposes 
of the United Nations. According to Princi­
ple (d) of the Declaration, states should inter 
alia co-operate in the economic, social, and 
science and technology fields, so as to pro­
mote economic growth especially of devel­
oping countries. 
Whereas GA Resolutions are not legally 
binding, they may reflect a certain degree of 
opinio iuris, which in connection with state 
practice is a constituent element for the crea­
tion of customary international law. 9 9 It 
could thus be asked whether customary in­
ternational law exists that provides for par­
ticipatory rights of developing countries re­
sulting from an international duty of states 
to co-operate in the field of science and 
technology. An opinio iuris to this end could 
be emphasised by the Charter of Economic 
Rights and Duties of States 1 0 0 , which in 
Art. 17 provides that international coopera­

tion for development is the shared goal and 
common duty of all states. 1 0 1 What becomes 
clear from these documents, however, is that 
states seem reluctant to commit to specific 
obligations of cooperation, let alone without 
consideration. Such understanding is under­
lined when taking a look at the principle of 
solidarity in public international law, which 
may well be regarded as the more general 
concept underlying these resolutions. In the 
light of transformation of public interna­
tional law from a right of co-existence to 
one of cooperation, 1 0 2 it is to be doubted that 
international solidarity may lead to one­
sided obligations. This is especially true 
when taking into account the principle of re­
ciprocity. Any one-sided rights of develop­
ing countries therefore contradict the current 
understanding of the solidarity principle. 
More recent documents regarding ICTs and 
the digital divide confirm this perception. 
The Okinawa Charter on Global Information 
Society, produced by the G8 at its summit in 
Okinawa in 2000, commits the G8 members 
to exercise their leadership to, inter alia, 
bridge the digital divide (para. 4). Yet, while 
providing for concrete actions (that have 
been implemented, such as the "Digital Op­
portunity Taskforce" whose report has been 
endorsed by the G8 Summit Meeting in 
Genoa in 2001), its language is again very 
vague ("promote", encourage"). It is thus 
doubtful that the G8 states meant to express 
their commitment in terms of corresponding 
rights for developing countries. Rather, it 
again remains at the discretion of states to 
take concrete steps. 
Finally, the outcome of the two phases of 
the World Summit on the Information Soci­
ety (WSIS) must certainly be taken into ac­
count when examining any opinio iuris re­
garding international cooperation to bridge 
the digital divide. WSIS was set up by the 
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UN following an ITU initiative, and 
aimed at building a people-centred, inclusive 
and development oriented information soci­
ety by bridging the digital divide. 1 0 4 The 
WSIS Geneva Declaration's 11 Principles 
set out key issues in this respect and con­
cludes with the commitment of strengthen­
ing cooperation in order to tackle these chal­
lenges. 1 0 5 The Geneva Plan of Action 1 0 6 

consequently sets out action lines regarding 
the issues defined in the Declaration. Of par­
ticular interest is action line C2.(d)(i), call­
ing for support studies by the ITU so as to 
broaden access to orbital resources, global 
frequency harmonization and global systems 
standardization. Action line C2.(i) encour­
ages the use of unused wireless capacity, in­
cluding satellite, especially in developing 
countries. Furthermore, action line D. deals 
with a "Digital Solidarity Agenda", which 
aims at putting in place the conditions for 
mobilizing human, financial and technologi­
cal resources for inclusion of all in the 
emerging information society. 1 0 7 The Tunis 
phase of WSIS, then, focussed mainly on fi­
nancial mechanisms for bridging the digital 
divide, on internet governance, and on im­
plementation of the Geneva and Tunis deci­
sions. 1 0 8 According to para. 31 of the Tunis 
Commitment, the "representatives of the 
peoples of the world" commit themselves to 
work towards the implementation of the 
Digital Solidarity Agenda (para. 27 of the 
Geneva Action Plan). The Tunis Agenda for 
the Information Society consequently deals 
with implementation and follow-up of the 
outcomes of Geneva and Tunis. Also here, 
effective cooperation on all levels is consid­
ered essential. 1 0 9 While these documents do 
contain palpable approaches to bridging the 
digital divide, based on international coop­
eration, specific corresponding rights can 
not be derived. 

At least with regard to any opinio iuris in 
this respect, there is not a single tangible 
line that can be drawn from all the resolu­
tions examined previously to the WSIS 
documents. While the documents may indi­
cate a general consensus that international 
cooperation is necessary, states seem reluc­
tant to commit to specific obligations, not 
least of all without consideration. Accord­
ingly, general public international law, i.e. 
customary international law, does not pro­
vide for substantial rights of developing 
countries regarding certain forms of coop­
eration with respect to satellite telecommu­
nications. 

VI. CONCLUSION 

Access to the orbit/spectrum resource is to a 
certain degree ensured by the ITU regulatory 
framework within the limits of allotment 
plans and allocation. There is no specified 
right to transfer of technology, albeit Art. 66 
(2) TRIPS obliges developed countries to 
promote the transfer of technology to LDCs. 
Moreover, there is no claim towards ITSO 
for continued provision of telecommunica­
tions services. Developing countries may, 
however, provide for universal service obli­
gations. 
What becomes clear from the above is that it 
is hard to speak of substantial legal rights 
with respect to interests regarding satellite 
telecommunications; commitments to inter­
national cooperation do exist, but at the 
same time contain considerable discretion 
on the part of the developed nations. In 
terms of public international law, the outer 
space legal regime and its concrétisation in 
the ITU regulatory framework suggest that 
there is some duty to cooperate, the details 
of which remain unclear and require further 
cooperation. 
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